
Quantity Item Description BarbCo Bor-It

1 30"/36" Horizontal Auger Boring Machine No Bid 117,600.00

1 8x30/36 casing attachment & saddle No Bid 2,490.00

1 12x30/36 casing attachment & saddle No Bid 2,490.00

1 18x30/36 casing attachment & saddle No Bid 2,490.00

1 24x30/36 casing attachmennt & saddle No Bid 2,490.00

1 30x30/36 casing attachment & saddle No Bid 2,490.00

1 8" on 2 1/4" hex Combo head w/ wingcutters No Bid 1,460.00

1 18" on 3" hex Combo head w/ wingcutters No Bid 2,245.00

1 30" on 3' hex Combo head w/ wingcutters No Bid 3,665.00

1 36" on 3" hex Combo head w/ wingcutters No Bid 4,190.00

10 8" on 2 1/4" hex x 10' auger No Bid 13,650.00

5 18" on 3" hex x 10' auger No Bid 12,700.00

5 30" on 3" hex x 10' auger No Bid 15,950.00

5 36" on 3" hex x 10' auger No Bid 17,950.00

1 3" male x 2 1/4" female adapter No Bid 445.00

1 frieght No Bid 900.00

Total Bid $0.00 $203,205.00

Hardin County Water District No. 2

Bid Tabulation

2026-002 Horizontal Auger Boring Machine

Thursday, March 12, 2026
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