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1 4" Flange Pack with Stainless Steel Bolts and Nuts $ 19.35] $§ 21.68] 1-2weeks | $ 22.95 Sf/:/):l;ktsoalto $ 23.39] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 4" Foster Adapter w/ Accessory Kit $ 68.76] $ 93.22] 3-4weeks | $ 88.83 Sf/:/):l;ktsoalto $ 93.27] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 4" Mechanical Joint Gland Pack $ 16.83] $ 24.50] 1-2weeks | $ 20.84 Sf/:/):l;ktsoalto $ 27.10] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 6" Foster Adapter w/ Accessory Kit $ 85.97] $ 111.64] 3-4weeks | $ 111.06 Sf/:/):l;ktsoalto $ 118.76] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 6" Mechanical Joint Gland Pack $ 19.80] $ 33.28] 1-2weeks | $ 28.72 Sf/:/):l;ktsoalto $ 36.10] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 6" Transition Gland Pack $ 22.28] $ 33.92] 1-2weeks | $ 29.18 Si‘:,t;;l;ktsoaltf) $ 44.65] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 6" Flange Pack with Stainless Steel Bolts and Nuts $ 33.42] $ 35.95] 1-2weeks | $ 28.58 st:/);zkt:)alto $ 35.22] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 8" Foster Adapter w/ Accessory Kit $ 124.68] $ 162.75] 3-4weeks | $ 161.06 st:/);zkt:)alto $ 184.47] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 8" Mechanical Joint Gland Pack $ 22.28] $ 37.40] 1-2weeks | $ 31.49 s'\::\:/,;zkt:)alto $ 44.24] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 8" Transition Gland Pack $ 25.15] $ 39.18] 1-2weeks | $ 33.35 s'\:/:;::kt:)alto $ 55.04] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 8" Flange Pack with Stainless Steel Bolts and Nuts $ 37.39] $ 39.90] 1-2weeks | $ 29.25 st:/);zkt:)alto $ 43.10] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 4" Transition Gland Pack $ -1 25.68] 1-2weeks | $ 22.69 s'\::\:/,;zkt:)alto $ 41.48] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 10" Foster Adapter $ -1 241.83] 3-4weeks | $ 238.83 Stf/);l;ktsoalto $ 278.42] 1-4 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
14 12" Foster Adapter w/ Accessory Pack $ -1 252.99] 3-4 weeks | $§ 249.94 Stf/):;ktsoa]to $ 287.16] 1-4 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 16" Foster Adapter $ -1 524.90] 5-6 weeks | $ 472.17 stf/);:;ktsoa]to NO BID 4-8 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 24" Foster Adapter $ -1 1,024.90] 5-6 weeks | $ 9216.61 stf/);:;ktsoa]to NO BID 4-8 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
17 20" Foster Adapter with Accessory Kit $ -1 794.90] 5-6 weeks | $ 705.50 Stf/);zktsoa]to NO BID 4-8 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 3/4" 90° CTS x CTS $ 22.39 NO BID NO BID $ 25.08 v3vze(:::53a6t $ 25.44]14-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
19 3/4" 90° CTS x FIPT $ 19.38 NO BID NO BID $ 22.62 v3vze(:::s3a6t $ 25.21]14-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 3/4" 90° FIPT x MIPT $ 10.87 NO BID NO BID $ 12.28 v3vze(:::s3a6t $ 13.99]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 3/4" 90° MIPT x CTS $ 15.59 NO BID NOBID | $ 17.45 ;i;:f:t $ 18.06 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 3/4" Corp Caps (grip nut) $ 5.70] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |4-32WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 3/4" CTS x 1/2" GALV $ 18.62 NO BID NOBID | $ 20.84 ;i;:f:t $ 24.2714-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 3/4" CTS x 1/2" MIPT $ 13.12] NoBID NoBID |$ 14.69 ;i;:f:t $ 18.00|4-32 WEEKS] NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 3/4"CTSx 1/2" PVC $ 23.26 NO BID NO BID $ 26.06 v3vze;ﬁs336t $ 34.4014-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
26 3/4" CTS x 3/4" CTS $ 17.33] $§ 26.06] 30 WEEKS | $ 19.40 v3vze;ﬁs336t $ 19.48]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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27 3/4" CTS x 3/4" FIPT (female pigtail) $ 14.82] $ 23.60] 30 WEEKS | $ 16.77 ﬁ;ﬁj:t $ 18.10]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
28 3/4" CTS x 3/4" GALV $ 19.18 NO BID NOBID | $ 21.48 ﬁ;ﬁj:t $ 26.16]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29 3/4" CTS x 3/4" MIPT (male pigtail) $ 14.22] $ 24.02] 30 WEEKS | $ 15.93 ﬁ;ﬁj:t $ 16.64 |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 3/4" CTS x 3/4" PVC $ 23.42 NO BID NOBID | $ 26.24 ﬁ;ﬁj:t $ 28.51|4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
31 3/4" CTS x 1" FIPT $ 17.82 NO BID NOBID | $ 19.96 ﬁ;ﬁj:t $ 21.76 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
32 3/4" CTS x 1" PVC $ 32.78 NO BID NOBID | $ 36.72 ‘,3\;;253; $ 37.98]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 3/4" FIPT x 1" FIPT $ 11.29 NO BID NOBID | $ 12.76 ‘,3\;;253; $ 12.89]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 3/4" FIPT x 1" PVC $ 29.32 NO BID NOBID | $ 31.51 ‘,3\;;253; NOBID |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 3/4" FIPT x 3/4" CTS (replaces flare nut) $ 16.34 NO BID NOBID | $ 18.13 ‘,3\;;253; NOBID |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 3/4" FIPT x 3/4" GALV $ 17.04 NO BID NOBID | $ 19.09 ‘,3\;;253; $ 19.34]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
37 3/4" FIPT x 3/4" PVC $ 18.72 NO BID NOBID | $ 20.96 ‘,3\;;::53; $ 24.85]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
38 3/4" FIPT x 3/4" PVC $ 18.72 NO BID NOBID | $ 20.96 ‘,3\;;:53; $ 24.85|4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 3/4" GALV x 1/2" MIPT $ 17.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 3/4" GALV x 3/4" MIPT $ 17.17 NO BID NOBID | $ 19.23 ;i;ﬁja(’t NOBID  |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 3/4" Grip Nut Joint Assembly for CTS $ 5.70] $ 15.49| 30 WEEKS | $ 6.38 ;i;ﬁja(’t NOBID |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
42 3/4" Meter Adapter $ 9.82 NO BID NOBID | $ 11.00 ;i;ﬁja(’t $ 22.40]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
43 3/4" Meuller Grip Nuts $ 13.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
44 3/4" MIPT x 1" CTS $ 15.76 NO BID NOBID | $ 17.65 ;Z;Ej:t $ 19.684-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
45 3/4" MIPT x 1" PVC $ 28.13 NO BID NOBID | § 31.51 ‘,3\/2::53; $ 34.99]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
46 3/4" MIPT x 1/2" GALV $ 15.64 NO BID NOBID | $ 17.52 ;i;:f:t $ 19.12]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
47 3/4" MIPT x 3/4" PVC $ 18.84 NO BID NOBID | $ 21.10 ;i;:fa(’t $ 22.08]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48 3/4" Tee, CTS x CTS x CTS $ 41.94] $ 61.81] 30 WEEKS | § 46.97 ‘,3\; ;:Zfa(’t $ 48.594-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
49 3/4" x 1" Tee, CTS x CTS x CTS $ 44.68 NO BID NOBID | § 50.04 ‘,3\/2::53; $ 51.87 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 1" 90° CTS x FIPT $ 32.92 NO BID NOBID | § 36.87 ‘,3\;;:53; $ 38.34]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
51 1" 90° Elbow CTS x CTS $ 28.77 NO BID NOBID | $ 32.21 v3vze§:s3a6t $ 33.50]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
52 1" 90° Elbow MIPT x CTS $ 25.93 NO BID NOBID | $ 29.04 v3vze§:s3a6t $ 30.22]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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53 1" Corp Caps (grip nut) $ 9.30 NO BID NOBID | § 10.41 ;i;zj:t NOBID |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 1"CTS x 1" CTS $ 19.82] $ 29.40] 30 WEEKS | $ 22.20 ;i;zj:t $ 22.50]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 1"CTS x 1" GALV $ 25.74 NO BID NOBID |$ 28.83 ;i;zj:t $ 36.78]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
56 1"CTS x 1" PVC $ 33.85 NO BID NOBID |$ 31.91 ;i;zj:t $ 43.74]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
57 1" CTS x 3/4" CTS $ 20.14] $ 29.69] 30 WEEKS | $ 22.56 ;i;zj:t $ 23.48]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
58 1" CTS x 3/4" PVC $ 24.74 NO BID NOBID |$ 27.81 ‘,3\;;253; $ 28.90]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
59 1" CTS x FIPT (replaces flare nut) $ 23.86 NO BID NOBID | $ 26.66 ‘,3\;;253; NOBID |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
60 1" FIPT x 1" CTS (female pigtail) $ 20.31] $ 33.79] 30 WEEKS | $ 22.75 ‘,3\;;253; $ 23.53]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
61 1" GALV x 1" MIPT $ 26.21 NO BID NOBID |§ 29.36 ‘,3\;;253; $ 32.16]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
62 1" GALV x 3/4" MIPT $ 20.16 NO BID NOBID |§ 24.30 ‘,3\;;253; NOBID |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
63 1" Grip Nut Joint Assembly for CTS $ 7.81 NO BID NOBID | $ 8.74 ‘,3\;;253; $ 11.894-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
64 1" MIPT x 1" CTS (male pigtail) $ 16.85] $ 26.06 $ 18.87 ;i;:ja(’t $ 19.36|4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
65 1" MIPT x 3/4" CTS $ 15.55 NO BID NOBID | § 17.41 ‘,3\;;:53; $ 18.724-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
66 1" Mueller Grip Nuts $ 18.96] $ 21.83 NO BID NO BID NOBID  |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
67 1" PVC x 3/4" PVC $ 34.53 NO BID NOBID |§ 38.68 ‘,3\;;:53; $ 41.71]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
68 1" Tee, CTS x CTS x CTS $ 44.88] $ 85.74 $ 50.26 ‘,3\;;:53; $ 53.11]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
69 1"x 3/4""Y", CTS x CTS x CTS $ 35.86 NO BID NOBID |§ 40.16 ‘,3\;;:53; $ 41.12]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
70 1" x 3/4" Meter Flange $ 23.61 NO BID NOBID |§ 26.43 ;ig:j:t $ 27.764-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
71 1" x 3/4" Tee, CTS x CTS x CTS $ 46.07) $ 169.34 $ 51.60 ;i;:f:t $ 54.81|4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
72 11/4"90° CTS x CTS $ 51.98 NO BID NOBID |§ 58.22 ;i;:f:t $ 60.97 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
73 1 1/4" 90° CTS x MIPT $ - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID  |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
74 11/4"CTSx 1 1/4" CTS $ 34.23 NO BID NOBID |$ 38.33 ;i;:f:t $ 45.11|4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
75 11/4"CTS x 1 1/4" GALV $ 64.84 NO BID NOBID |$ 79.88 ;i;:f:t $ 82.91|4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
76 11/4"CTS x 1 1/4" MIPT $ 32.21 NO BID NOBID |$ 36.08 ;i;:f:t $ 39.11|4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
77 11/4"FIPT x 1 1/4" CTS $ 37.08 NO BID NOBID | $ 43.27 ‘,3\,2::53; $ 72.11]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
78 11/4" GALV x 1 1/4" MIPT $ 37.02 NO BID NOBID | $ 41.45 ‘,3\;;:53; $ 44.29]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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79 11/4"PVCx 1 1/4" PVC $ 61.17 NO BID NOBID |$ 69.06 ;i;ﬁjaét $ 73.12]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
80 11/2"90° CTS x CTS $ 92.37 NO BID NOBID | $ 103.45 ;i;ﬁjaét $ 113.22 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
81 11/2" 90° CTS x MIPT $ 75.29 NO BID NOBID |$ 84.33 ;i;ﬁjaét $ 91.85|4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
82 11/2"CTSx 1 1/2" GALV $ 85.80 NO BID NOBID |$ 96.10 ;i;ﬁjaét $ 95.11]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
83 11/2" CTS x 1 1/2" MIPT (pigtail) $ 46.16| $ 72.80 $ 51.71 ;i;ﬁjaét $ 56.11]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
84 11/2"CTSx 1 1/2" PVC $ 91.25] $ 115.92 $ 102.20 ‘,3\;;253; $ 115.11 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
85 11/2" CTS x CTS $ 66.33| $ 109.88 $ 74.29 ‘,3\;;::53; $ 77.75]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
86 11/2" GALV x 1 1/2" MIPT $ 52.96 NO BID NOBID |$ 59.31 ‘,3\;;::53; $ 62.79|4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
87 11/2" GALV x GALV $ 65.74 NO BID NOBID |$ 73.62 ‘,3\;;::53; $ 77.04] 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
88 1 1/2" Meter Flanges $ 41.13 NO BID NOBID |$ 46.07 ‘,3\;;::53; $ 71.88]4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
89 11/2"PVCx 1 1/2" PVC $ 83.84 NO BID NOBID |$ 93.90 ‘,3\;;::53; $ 98.27 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
90 1 1/2" x 1" Meter Adapters A46 $ 137.24 NO BID NOBID | $ 153.71 \,3\;;::53; $ 160.52 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
91 2" 90° CTS x CTS $ 186.89] $ 292.38 $ 209.31 "3\;;:53; $ 219.51 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
92 2" 90° MIPT x CTS $ 107.91 NO BID NOBID | $ 120.86 "3\;;:53; $ 124.77 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
93 2" CTS x 1 1/2" MIPT $ 55.57 NO BID NOBID |$ 62.24 "3\;;:53; $ 64.87 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
94 2"CTSx 2" CTS $ 89.55] $ 139.71 $ 100.29 "3\;;:53; $ 104.85 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
95 2" CTS x 2" GALV $ 93.24 NO BID NOBID | $ 104.42 "3\;;:53; $ 122.10 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
96 2" CTS x 2" PVC $ 106.53] $ 149.00 $ 119.31 \,3\/2::53; $ 146.19 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
97 2" FIPT x 2" CTS $ 70.31] $ 119.00 $ 78.75 ;i;:f:t $ 85.20 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
98 2" FIPT x 2" GALV $ 82.80 NO BID NOBID |$ 92.74 "3\;;:53; $ 99.25|4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
99 2" Grip Nut Joint Assembly for CTS $ 23.04 NO BID NOBID | § 25.81 "3\2;:53; NOBID |4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
100 2"MIPT x 1 1/2" CTS $ 65.40 NO BID NOBID |$ 76.34 ;i;:f:t $ 79.22|4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
101 2" MIPT x 1 1/2" FIPT $ 15.00 NO BID NOBID |$ 89.97 "3\;;:53; $ 15.00] 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
102 2" MIPT x 2" CTS (pigtail) $ 67.26) $ 111.41 $ 75.33 ;i;:f:t $ 78.67 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
103 2" MIPT x 2" GALV $ 69.03 NO BID NOBID | $ 77.32 "3\,2::53; $ 82.49|4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
104 2" MIPT x 2" PVC $ 84.04| $ 123.71 $ 94.13 ;ﬁ;ﬁg’t $ 101.51 | 4-32 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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105 | 2"Multiservice "Y", Manifold $ 69.95s] NOBID NOBID |§ 78.33 ;i:ﬁj:t $ 86.45|4-32 WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
106 | 2"PVCx2"FIPT $ 96.56] $  142.21 $  108.14 ;i:ﬁj:t $  113.41]|432weeks| NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
107 | 2"PVCx2" GALV $ 106.68] NOBID NOBID |$  119.47 ;i:ﬁj:t $  147.85|4-32WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
108 | 2"PVCx2'PVC $ 126.82] NOBID NOBID |$  142.04 ;i:ﬁj:t $ 15521432 wWEEks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
109 | 2"Tee, CTS x CTS x CTS $ 24421]$  393.20 $ 27352 ;i:ﬁj:t $  301.10|4-32wWEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
110 | 2"x 1" Tee, CTS x CTS x FIPT $ 11234] NOBID NOBID |$ 12583 ‘,3\;;253; $  132.95|4-32wWEeeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
111 | 2"x3/4"Tee, CTS x CTS x FIPT $ 112.34] NOBID NOBID |$ 12583 ‘,3\;;253; $  131.40|4-32WEEKS|] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
112 | Fire Hydrant, 3 Bury $ 1,986.69] § 3,078.34] 36 WEEKS | § 3.456.17 saﬁr("ls‘":;f $  2809.93|2-24 weeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
113 | Fire Hydrant, 3 1/2' Bury $ 203509|$ 3,158.17]| 36 WEEKS | §  3,540.41 saﬁr("ls‘":;f $ 2922.33|2-24weeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
114 | Fire Hydrant, 4’ Bury $ 208349| s 3228.25] 36 WEEKS | §  3.624.68 saﬁr("ls‘":;f $ 2991.82|2-24 weeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
115 | Fire Hydrant, 4 1/2' Bury $ 2131.89] $ 3,307.98] 36 WEEKS | § 3,708.92 saﬁr("ls‘":;f $ 3,015.29|2-24 weeks| NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
116 | Fire Hydrant, 5 Bury $ 218029 s 3,377.87] 36 WEEKS | § 3,793.17 saﬁr(l"s‘":;f $ 3,083.74|2-24 weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
117 | Fire Hydrant, 5 1/2' Bury $ 222868|$s 3457.14] 36 WEEKS | § 3.877.42 sa?i:.svf;'f $ 3,201.85|2-24 Wweeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
118 | Fire Hydrant, 6' Bury $ 2277.08] § 5,099.08] 36 WEEKS | § 3.,961.68 sa?i:.svf;'f $ 3,220.65|2-24 Weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
119 | 1 1/2' Hydrant Extension (Kennedy) $ -| w~osD NoBID |§  509.04 JVZES'; $  828.09]|2-12weeks|] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
120 | 1'Hydrant Extension (Kennedy) $ -| w~osD NoBID |§ 44436 JVZES'; $  729.74|2-12weeks|] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
121 | 2'Hydrant Extension (Kennedy) $ -| w~osD NOoBID |$§ 56448 JVZES'; $  899.67|2-12weeks|] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
122 | 3'Hydrant Extension  Kennedy) $ -| w~osBD NOBID |$  854.40 v'vi ;Es':t $ 1418.19|212weeks] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
123 | 6"x 13" Swivel Hydrant Adapter $ |s 16988) 24wEEKS | §  163.03 Sf’:”;:l:s"a't(’ $  194.76|2-12wWeeks|] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
124 | 6"x 18" Swivel Hydrant Adapter $  16659]|$s 187.72| 24 wEeEks | §  179.72 Sf’:”;:’g’a‘t{’ $  214.68|2-12weeks|] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
125 3" Flange Packs with Stainless Steel Bolts $ -1 13.88] 1-2 WEEKS | $§ 11.59 4;;2;:::?;? $ 19.99] 1-4 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
126 | 3"Blind Flange w/ 2" FIPT Center $ 51.36] $ 56.48| 2-3 weeks | § 54.19 Sﬁ:ifa‘t{’ $ 62.95] 1-4 WEEKS | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
127 | 3"Flanged Tee $ 9831] s  108.26] 23wEEKks | §  103.75 szgzl::;t(’ $ 12052]| 1-4weeks | nNoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
128 | 4" Ductile Iron Spool Piece, 6 ft. length $ 381.72| §  449.16] 10WEEKS | §  599.71 43';‘1;5‘";?"‘:'25 $ 516.24| 28weeks | NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
129 | 4"x3"Flanged Reducer $ 74.97] $ 80.48| 2-3 WEEKS | $ 77.35 S:/(\:;Ie(l:soaltb $ 89.85| 28 weeks | NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
130 | 4" Mechanical Joint x 3" Flange Reducer $ -| nw~osD NOoBID |$ 27212 Sf:;:l:s"a't(’ $ 103.95] 28wWeeks | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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131 | 4"Flange Tee $ s 21392] 23wEeks | §  294.12 Sf/(v):zktsoalt(, $ 247.45| 28wWeeks | NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
132 | 3"Mechanical Joint X Flange Adapter $ 13 49.40| 2-3 WEEKS | $ 50.95 Sf/(v):zktsoalt(, $ 68.65| 28 WEEKS | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
133 | 4" Mechanical Joint X Flange Adapter $ 1 69.44| 2-3 WEEKS | § 58.36 Sf/(v):zktsoalt(, $ 77.61] 28 WEEKS | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
134 | 6" Mechanical Joint x Flange Adapter $ 1 95.12| 2-3 WEEKS | § 80.13 Stv':gz:ffaltb $ 107.95| 28weeks | NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
135 | 5/8"x 3/4" Badger M25 Meter $ 15495] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 136.90] 8 weeks NO BID NO BID
136 | 5/8"x 3/4" Sensus SR Il Meter $ 14791] NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
137 | Sensus 520M SmartPoint® Module, Single Port $ 14428 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
138 | 3/4" Meter Gasket (rubber) $ 0.11] $ 0.12 $ 0.33] stock NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
139 | 3/4" Pentek Plastic Meter Box Riser, 3" Tall $ 2571 NoBID NoBID |$ 17.99 ":r:’i‘; e:i’::eat NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
140 | 3/4" Pentek Plastic Meter Box Riser, 6" Tall $ 47.14| NoBID NoBID |$ 33.29 ":r:’i‘; e:i’::eat NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
141 i./: Pentek Plastic Meter Box Top, with Snap Lock Meter Reader | ¢ 4429 NOBID NnoBID |$ 24.95 ":r:’i‘; e:i’::eat NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
142 | Jumbo Pentek or equivalent Meter Box Riser, 6" Tall $ 58.57] NOBID NoBID |§ 33.21 l(:P:’i‘; e:i’::eat NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
143 | Jumbo Pentek or equivalent Plastic Meter Box $ 9429 NoOBID NoBD |§ 53.80 "t)r‘l’i"s e:i’::eat NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
144 | Jumbo Pentek Plastic Meter Top or Equivalent, with Snap Lock $ 77.14] NOBID NOBID |$ a3.gs| 1OWweeksatl  NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Meter Reader Lid this time
145 | DFW or equivalent 24x36x24 Box and Lid $ 493.72] §  460.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
146 | 1"Sensus SR2 Meter, 7" ER $ -| w~osD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
147 | 1" Rubber Meter Gasket $ -1 0.15 $ 0.37] stock NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
148 | 1"Badger M55 Meter $ -| w~osBD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 217.93] 8 weeks NO BID NO BID
149 | 11/2" Sensus OMNI C2 Meter $ -| w~osBD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
150 | 2"Sensus OMNI C2 Meter (Long Length) $ -| w~osBD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
151 2" Register for Sensus OMNI C2 Meter $ - NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
152 | 3"Sensus OMNI C2 Meter $ -| w~osBD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
153 | 4"Sensus OMNI C2 Meter $ -| w~osBD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
154 | 4"Sensus OMNI T2 Meter $ -| w~osBD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
155 | 6"Sensus OMNI C2 Meter $ -| nw~osD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
156 | 6"Sensus OMNI T2 Meter $ -| nw~osD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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157 | 3/4" Angled Dual Check Valve Assembly $ 59.86] NOBID NoBID |§ 67.04 ;i:ﬁjabt $ 75.51]|4-32 WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
158 | 3/4" Dual Check Valve Repair Kit $ 12.60] $ 21.88| 12 WEEKS | § 14.71 ;i:ﬁjabt $ 15.89]|4-32 WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
159 | 3/4"x 12" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 26.64] $ 92.82| 46 WEEKS | NOBID NOBID |$ 28.73|4-32 Weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
160 | 3/4"x 3" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 6.74] $ 19.24| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 32.26 Zaﬁ:is"‘;f;';s $ 7.27]4-32 WEEKS] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
161 | 3/4"x 6" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 12.05] $ 30.08| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 68.25 Zaﬁ:is"‘;f;';s $ 13.00]4-32 WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
162 | 17x 12" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 24.81] § 92.82| 4-6 Weeks | NOBID NO BID NOBID |[4-32wWEeeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
163 | 1"x 3" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 6.74] $ 30.08| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 14.72 Za?:sis"‘:f;f NOBID |[4-32weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
164 | 1"x 6" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 11.77] $ 30.08| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 29.61 Za?:sis"‘:f;f NOBID |[4-32weeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
165 | 1"x 9" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 20.17] § 66.18| 4-6 WEEks | NOBID NO BID NOBID |[4-32weeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
166 | 11/4"x 12" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 95911 § 10555 46 wWeeks | NoBID NO BID NOBID |[4-32weeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
167 | 11/4"x 3" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 7.28] $ 17.65] 4-6 WEEKS | § 15.17 Za?:sis"‘:f;f NOBID |[4-32weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
168 | 11/4"x 6" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 12.68] $ 31.10| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 30.16 Za?;sis"‘:f:f NOBID |[4-32weeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
169 | 11/2"x 3" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 7.46] $ 17.90] 4-6 WEEKS | § 15.49 Za:‘;sis‘":f;': NOBID |[4-32weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
170 | 1 1/2" x 6" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 12.85] $ 35.09| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 30.53 Za:‘;sis‘":f;': NOBID |[4-32weeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
171 1 1/2" x 12" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp $ 2856 §  10555| 46 weeks | NoBID NO BID NOBID |[4-32weeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
172 | 2" Angled Dual Check Valve $ 259.84] NOBID NOBID |$§  291.02 \,3\; ;:j;t NOBID |[4-32weeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
173 | 2"x 3" Romac Repair Clamp $ 20.27] NOBID NnoBiD |$ 16.86 Za:‘;sis‘":f;': NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
174 | 2"x 6" Romac Repair Clamp $ 37.66] $ 98.23| 4-6 wEEKs | § 31.34 Zaﬁ,fis"‘:fn‘:';s NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
175 | 2" x 9" Romac Repair Clamp $ 9474 $  168.77| 46 WEEKS | § 10254 Zaﬁ:is“:fn‘:': NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
176 | 2" x 12" Romac Repair Clamp $ 15432]$  193.14| 46 WEEKs | §  109.30 Zaﬁ:is“:fn‘:': NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
177 4" Harco Flow control Gasketed Repair Coupling, C200 Class 150 $ 52.23 NO BID NO BID $ 51.95 Svtvzcel:(zoa: $ 122.10 | 2-8 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
178 4" Harco Flow control Gasketed Repair Coupling, IPS Class 200 $ 52.09 NO BID NO BID $ 51.80 Svtv(:::(zoa: $ 70.00] 2-8 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
179 | 4" Romac Extended Range Coupling, 12" Sleeve Length $ 17252]$  302.22 $  199.32 3;;‘2:““:?"‘:': NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
180 | 4"x7 1/2" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, AC Class 200 $ 5155] §  152.42| 46 weeks | § 53.05 Zaﬁ:is“;fnil;s $ 57.83| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
181 | 4"x7 1/2" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, PVC $ 51550 $  131.75| 46 wEEKS | § 53.05 Za:"tsis“;fn‘:ts $ 55.65| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
182 | 4" X 15" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, AC Class 200 $ 97.03| §  269.21| 46 WEEKS | §  103.24 Za:"tsis“;fn‘:';s $  104.64| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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183 | 6"x 7 1/2" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, Class 200 AC $ 67.07] $  182.38] 4-6 WEEKS | § 71.36 Zaﬁ:is"‘;f;': $ 72.41| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
184 | 6"x 15" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, Class 200 AC $ 11266|$ 32851| 46 WEEKS | §  119.54 Zaﬁ:is‘";f;': $  121.49| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
185 | 6"x7 1/2" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, PVC $ 67.07] $  182.38| 46 WEEKS | § 71.36 Zaﬁ:is"‘;f;': $ 72.33| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
186 | 6"x 15" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, PVC $ 11266|$ 32851| 46 WEEKS | §  119.54 Zaﬁ:is‘";f;': $  121.49| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
187 6" Harco Flow control Gasketed Repair Coupling, IPS Class 200 $ 91.55 NO BID NO BID $ 921.05 Svtvoeceli(zc;:l $ 109.29 | 2-8 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
188 6" Harco Flow control Gasketed Repair Coupling, C900 Class 150 $ 80.12 NO BID NO BID $ 79.68 Svtvoeceli(zc;:l $ 252.10] 2-8 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
189 | 6" Romac Extended Range Coupling, 12" Sleeve Length $ 22756|$  397.43| 46 WEEKS | §  247.21 3;:;:‘:?;': NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
190 | 8"x7 1/2" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, AC Class 200 $ 78.24] $§  213.73| 46 wEEKs | § 83.68 Za:‘;sis“;f;f $ 88.60] 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
191 | 8"x 15" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, AC Class 200 $ 13623|$ 391.97| 46 WEEKS | §  137.21 Za:‘;sis“;f;f $  149.60| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
192 | 8"x7 1/2" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, PVC $ 78.24] $  213.73| 46 wEEKs | § 83.68 Za:‘;sis“;f;f $ 89.56] 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
193 | 8" x 15 Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, PVC $ 13623]$s  391.97| 46 wEEKs | §  137.21 Za?:sis"‘:f;f $  145.28| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
194 | 8 HarcoFlow control Gasketed Repair Coupling, IPS Class 200 s 18857 wNoBiD |aeweeks |s  18zs8| St°k*?% I« 23000| 28 wEEKs | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID

(SDR21) weeks at
195 8" Harco Flow control Gasketed Repair Coupling, C200 Class 150 $ 193.19 NO BID 4-6 \WEEKS | $ 192.18 Svtvc:;l;;oa:l $ 451.89 ]| 2-8 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
196 | 8" Romac Extended Range Coupling, 12" Sleeve Length $ 26720 $  466.07| 46 WEEKS | §  311.28 3;‘;;:‘:?;': NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
197 | 10"x 7 1/2" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, Ductile Iron $ 9431] $  301.54| 46 wEEKs | § 97.06 Za:‘;sis“;f;f $  103.21] 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
198 | 10" x 15" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, Ductile Iron $ 17037|$ 543.63| 46 WEEKS | §  175.34 Za:‘;sis“;f;f $ 191.18] 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
199 | 10"x 15" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, PVC $ 14064 $ 543.63| 46 wEEKsS | § 17534 Za:‘;sis“;f;': $ 191.18| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
200 | 10" x 20" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, PVC $ 22751|s 725.89| 46 wEEKS | §  234.14 Zaﬁ,fis“;fn‘:';s $  253.89| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
201 10" Romac Extended Range Coupling, 12" Sleeve Length $ 32463|$ 564.04] 46WEEKS | § 41835 Zaﬁ:is“:fn‘:': NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
202 | 12"x7 1/2" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, Ductile Iron $ 107.21)$s 363.13| 46WEEKS | §  103.44 Za't:otlfis“:fnile(:s $ 113.66| 721DAYSs | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
203 | 12" x 15" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, Ductile Iron $ 19483|$ 67298] 46 WEEKS | §  187.03 Zaﬁ,fis“:fn‘:': $  204.11| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
204 | 12" x 15" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, PVC $ 19483|$ 67298] 46 WEEKS | §  187.03 Za't:otlfis“:fnile(:s $ 197.83] 721 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
205 | 12" x 20" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, PVC $ 27149|$  787.01| 46 WEEKS | §  260.64 Zaﬁ:is“:fn(:l: $  281.74| 7-21 DAYS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
206 | 12" Romac Extended Range Coupling, 12" Sleeve Length $ 37652|$ 65694 46WEEKS | §  487.16 Za't:ot:is“:fnile(:s NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
207 | 4" 11 1/4° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ 1 48.35| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 46.32 S::;Ie(l:soaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
208 | 4"221/2° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ 1 50.28] 4-6 WEEKS | § 48.17 S::;Ie(l:soaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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209 4" 45° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 53.18] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 50.95 St:/’:';ktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
210 4" 90° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 63.82] 4-6 \WEEKS | $ 61.14 St:/’:';ktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
211 4" x 12" Solid Sleeve, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 56.57] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 51.19 St:,):l;ktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
212 | 4"x 15" Stainless Steel Repair Clamp, PVC $ Is 23269) 46wEEKS | §  161.38 Za:C::is‘";ie;': NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
213 6" 11 1/4° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 80.75] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 77.35 St:/’:';ktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
214 6" 22 1/2° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 76.88] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 66.46 Stt/);zl:soaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
215 6" 45° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 84.61] 4-6 \WEEKS | $ 73.15 st:/);zkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
216 6" 90° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 104.44] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 100.04 sfzgzl:altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
217 6" x 2" Mechanical Joint Cap x FIPT, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 68.17] 4-6 \WEEKS | $ 65.31 sfzgzl:altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
218 6" Mechanical Joint Cap, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -13 42.55] 4-6 \WEEKS | $ 40.76 st:/);zkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
219 6" Mechanical Joint Plug, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 56.08] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 53.73 st:/);zkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
220 6" x 4" Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 Reducer $ -1 60.92] 4-6 \WEEKS | $ 58.36 St:/);zkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
221 6" x 12" Solid Sleeve, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 94.76] 4-6 \WEEKS | $ 90.78 stf/);zktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
222 6" x 4" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 139.25] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 133.39 stf/);zktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
223 6" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 149.89] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 143.58 Stf/);zktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
224 8" 11 1/4° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 109.27 ] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 104.67 Stf/);zktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
225 8" 22 1/2° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 120.39] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 115.33 Stf/);zktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
226 8" 45° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 123.29] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 118.11 Stf::ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
227 8" 90° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 150.85] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 144.51 S:/(\:;:ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
228 8" x 2" Mechanical Joint Cap x FIPT, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 94.76] 4-6 \WEEKS | $ 90.78 S:z;:ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
229 8" Mechanical Joint Cap, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 69.62] 4-6 \WEEKS | $ 66.69 S:z;:ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
230 8" Mechanical Joint Plug, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 82.68] 4-6 \WEEKS | $ 79.20 S:z;:ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
231 8" x 4" Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 Reducer $ -1 82.68] 4-6 \WEEKS | $ 79.20 S:z;:ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
232 8" x 6" Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 Reducer $ -1 88.48] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 84.76 S:/(\:Se(ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
233 8" x 12" Solid Sleeve, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 152.30] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 145.89 S:;;le(ktsoalf NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
234 8" x 4" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 161.98] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 155.16 S:;;le(ktsoalt(, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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235 8" x 6" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 185.67 | 4-6 WEEKS | $ 177.85 St:,):gktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
236 8" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 224.35] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 214.91 St:,):gktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
237 10" 11 1/4° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 176.48] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 169.05 St:,):gktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
238 10" 22 1/2° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 177.45] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 169.98 St:,):gktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
239 10" 45° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 177.93] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 170.44 St:,):gktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
240 10" 90° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 238.85] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 228.80 St:/);zl:soaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
241 10" x 12" Solid Sleeve, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 182.28 ] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 174.61 sfzgzkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
242 10" x 6" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 239.82] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 229.73 sfzgzkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
243 10" x 8" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 280.43] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 268.63 st:/);zkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
244 10" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 320.08] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 306.61 sfzgzkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
245 12" 11 1/4° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 218.06] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 208.88 sfzgzkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
246 12" 22 1/2° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 232.57] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 222.78 sfzgzkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
247 12" 45° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 265.93] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 254.74 Stf/);zktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
248 12" 90° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 321.53] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 308.00 Stf/);zktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
249 12" x 2" Mechanical Joint Cap, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 155.69] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 149.14 Stf/);zktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
250 12" Mechanical Joint Cap, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 130.06] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 124.59 stf/);zktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
251 12" Mechanical Joint Plug, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 142.15] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 136.17 Stf/);zktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
252 12" x 10" Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 Reducer $ -1 169.23] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 162.11 Stf::ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
253 12" x 4" Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 Reducer $ -1 170.19] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 163.03 S:z;:ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
254 12" x 6" Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 Reducer $ -1 149.40] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 143.12 S:z;:ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
255 12" x 8" Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 Reducer $ -1$ 152.30 4-6 WEEKS | $ 145.89 S:/(\:;:ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
256 12" x 12" Solid Sleeve, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 245.14] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 234.82 S:z;:ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
257 12" x 10" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 448.21] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 429.35 S:z;:ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
258 12" x 4" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 303.16] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 290.40 S:/(\:Se(ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
259 12" x 6" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 303.16 4-6 WEEKS | $ 290.40 szzle(l:soaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
260 12" x 8" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 348.61| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 333.94 szzle(l:soaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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261 12" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 446.77] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 427.96 Sf/:/):zktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
262 14" x 15" Solid Sleeve, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 370.37] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 354.78 St:,):l;ktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
263 16" 11 1/4° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 528.00| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 505.77 Sf/:/):zktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
264 16" 22 1/2° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 498.98] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 477.98 Sf/:/):zktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
265 16" 45° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 520.26 4-6 WEEKS | $ 498.36 Sf/:/):zktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
266 16" 90° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 727.69| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 697.05 szgzktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
267 16" x 8" MJ Reducer $ -1 371.34] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 355.71 sz;zl:altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
268 16" x 15" Solid Sleeve, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 468.52] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 448.80 st:/);zkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
269 16" x 10" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 894.02] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 856.38 sz;zl:altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
270 16" x 12" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 807.95] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 773.94 sz;zl:altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
271 16" x 6" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 622.28] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 596.08 st:/);zkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
272 16" x 8" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 675.95] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 647.49 St:/);zkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
273 16" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 1,019.73] 46 WEEKS | $ 976.80 szgzktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
274 20" 11 1/4° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 808.43] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 774.40 szgzktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
275 20" 22 1/2° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 858.24] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 822.11 szgzktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
276 20" 45° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 821.49] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 786.91 szgzktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
277 20" 90° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 1,260.04] 46 WEEKS | $§ 1,219.83 szgzktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
278 20" x 15" Solid Sleeve, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 746.06| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 714.65 Stf:;:ktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
279 20" x 10" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 1,415.73] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 1,356.13 S:/(\:;:l:soa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
280 20" x 12" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 1,294.37| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 1,239.87 S:/(\:;:l:soa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
281 20" x 16" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 1,274.06] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 1,220.42 S:/(\:;:l:soa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
282 20" x 6" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 1,023.12] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 980.04 S:/(\:;:ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
283 20" x 8" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 1,046.32] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 1,002.27 S:z;:ktsoa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
284 20" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 1,403.16] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 1,344.08 S:/(\:;Ie(l:soa]tb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
285 24" 11 1/4° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 1,079.20] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 1,033.77 szzle(l:soaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
286 24" 22 1/2° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 1,152.21] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 1,103.71 szzle(l:soaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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287 24" 45° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 124795 46 WEEKS | $ 1,195.41 stzktsoalt(, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
288 24" 90° Bend, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -|$ 188087| 46 WEEKS | $ 1,801.68 stzktsoalt(, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
289 24" x 15" Solid Sleeve, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 982.02] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 940.67 stzktsoalt(, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
290 24" x 10" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ - NO BID NO BID $ 1,602.53 stzktsoalt(, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
291 24" x 12" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 144764 46 WEEKS | $§ 1,386.69 stzktsoalt(, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
292 24" x 16" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -|$ 1,82237| 46 WEEKS | $§ 1,745.64 szgzktsoalt(, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
293 24" x 6" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1 1,231.51] 4-6 WEEKS | $ 1,179.66 st:/);zkt:)altb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
294 24" x 8" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 1,246.02] 46 WEEKS | $§ 1,193.56 sfzgzktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
295 24" Tee, Mechanical Joint, Ductile Iron Class 350 $ -1$ 208153 46 WEEKS | $§ 1,993.89 sfzgzktsoaltb NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
296 4" Pipe Restraint for C900 w/Accessory Kit $ -13 45.14] 4 WEEKS | $ 41.57 svtv(zeceliéc;ts NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
297 4" Pipe Restraint for Ductile Iron w/Accessory Kit $ -1 39.27] 4WEEKS | $ 36.16 svtv(zeceliéc;ts NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
298 4" Pipe Restraint for PVC w/Accessory Kit $ -1 45.14] 4\WEEKS | $ 42.40 svtvzceli(zc;ts NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
299 6" Pipe Restraint for C900 w/Accessory Kit $ -13 56.51] 4 WEEKS $ 56.19 Svtvc:;l;(ZOatS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
300 6" Pipe Restraint for Ductile Iron w/Accessory Kit $ -1 48.51] 4 WEEKS $ 45.57 Svtvc:;l;(ZOatS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
301 6" Pipe Restraint for PVC w/Accessory Kit $ -1 56.51] 4 \XEEKS $ 56.19 Svtvc:;l;(ZOatS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
302 8" Pipe Restraint for C900 w/Accessory Kit $ -1 76.24] 4 WEEKS $ 75.82 Svtvc:;l;(ZOatS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
303 8" Pipe Restraint for Ductile Iron w/Accessory Kit $ -1 66.10] 4 WEEKS $ 60.88 Svtvc:;l;(ZOatS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
304 8" Pipe Restraint for PVC w/Accessory Kit $ -1 76.24] 4 \XEEKS $ 75.82 Svtvc:;l;(ZOatS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
305 12" Pipe Restraint for C900 w/Accessory Kit $ -1 139.31] 4 WEEKS $ 125.73 Svtvzcel:(zoats NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
306 | 12" Pipe Restraint for Ductile Iron w/Accessory Kit $ s 12635] aweeks | §  107.02 Svtv:‘::(;"ats NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
307 10" Pipe Restraint for C900 w/Accessory Kit $ -1 132.74) 4 WEEKS $ 112.45 Svtvzcel:(zoats NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
308 | 10" Pipe Restraint for Ductile Iron w/Accessory Kit $ s 94.01] a4weeks | 93.48 Svtv:‘::(;"ats NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
309 10" Pipe Restraint for PVC w/Accessory Kit $ -1 132.74) 4 WEEKS $ 128.91 Svtvzcel:(zoats NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
310 | 14" Pipe Restraint for Ductile Iron w/Accessory Kit $ -Is 16805] aweeks |§  167.12 Svt\;‘::(;"ats NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
311 16" Pipe Restraint for Ductile Iron w/Accessory Kit $ -1 226.71] 4 WEEKS $ 217.11 Svtvzceli(zoaf NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
312 20" Pipe Restraint for Ductile Iron w/Accessory Kit $ -1 374.10] 4 WEEKS $ 316.92 Svtvzceli(zoaf NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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313 24" Pipe Restraint for Ductile Iron w/Accessory Kit $ -1 506.92] 4 WEEKS | $ 429.43 Sv'\:loeceli(zc;ts NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
314 2" x 3/4" Saddle, PVC $ 19.83] $ 32.33] 16 WEEKS | $ 22.20 \?vze;:zjabt $ 23.21]4-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
315 2" x 1" Saddle, PVC $ 19.83] $ 32.33 $ 22.20 \?vze;:zjabt $ 23.21]4-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
316 4" x 3/4" Saddle, AC $ 45.39 NO BID NO BID $ 93.43 \?vze;:zjabt NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
317 4" x 1" Saddle, AC $ 56.43 NO BID NO BID $ 93.43 \?vze;:zjabt NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
318 4" x 2" Saddle, AC $ 62.37 NO BID NO BID $ 118.62 "3\;;253; NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
319 4" x 3/4" Saddle, C900 $ 33.64) $ 54.83] 16 WEEKS | § 37.68 v3vi¢:(’s3a6t $ 39.39]14-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
320 4" x 1" Saddle, C200 $ 33.64) $ 54.83] 16 WEEKS | $§ 37.68 v3vi¢:(’s3a6t $ 39.39]14-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
321 4" x 2" Saddle, C200 $ 84.11] $ 135.58] 16 WEEKS | $ 94.20 v3vi¢:(’s3a6t $ 98.484-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
322 4" x 3/4" Saddle, PVC $ 30.79] $ 50.20] 16 WEEKS | $ 34.47 "3\;;253; $ 36.04]4-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
323 4" x 1" Saddle, PVC $ 30.79] $ 50.20] 16 WEEKS | $§ 34.47 "3\;;253; $ 36.04]4-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
324 4" x 2" Saddle, PVC $ 66.30] $ 108.10] 16 WEEKS | $ 74.26 v3vze;:(,s336t $ 79.2214-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
325 6" x 3/4" Saddle, AC $ 102.40 NO BID NO BID $ 110.06 v3vze¢::s3aét NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
326 6" x 1" Saddle, AC $ 102.40 NO BID NO BID $ 110.06 v3vze¢::s3aét NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
327 6" x 2" Saddle, AC $ 128.64 NO BID NO BID $ 138.25 v3vze¢::s3aét NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
328 6" x 3/4" Saddle, C900 $ 45.93] $ 74.07] 16 WEEKS | § 51.43 v3vze¢::s3a6t $ 53.15]4-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
329 6" x 1" Saddle, C200 $ 45.93] $ 74.07] 16 WEEKS | § 51.43 v3vze¢::s3a6t $ 53.15]4-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
330 6" x 2" Saddle, C900 $ 86.67] $ 141.28] 16 WEEKS | $ 97.06 v3vze(:::s3a6t $ 105.83 | 4-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
331 6" x 3/4" Saddle, PVC $ 45.93] $ 74.90] 16 WEEKS | $§ 51.43 v3vze;::s3a6t $ 54.29]4-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
332 6" x 1" Saddle, PVC $ 45.93] $ 74.90] 16 WEEKS | $§ 51.43 v3vze;::s3a6t $ 54.29]4-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
333 6" x 2" Saddle, PVC $ 86.67) $ 141.32] 16 WEEKS | § 97.06 v3vze;::s3a6t $ 109.44 | 4-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
334 8" x 3/4" Saddle, AC $ 126.74 NO BID NO BID $ 136.21 v3vze;::s3a6t NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
335 8" x 1" Saddle, AC $ 126.74 NO BID NO BID $ 136.21 v3vze;::s3a6t NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
336 8" x 2" Saddle, AC $ 145.25 NO BID NO BID $ 156.11 v3vze;::s3a6t NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
337 8" x 3/4" Saddle, C9200 $ 64.29] $ 104.80] 16 WEEKS | $ 72.00 ;i;zjabt $ 76.81]4-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
338 8" x 1" Saddle, C200 $ 64.29] $ 104.80] 16 WEEKS | $ 72.00 ;i;zjabt $ 76.81]4-36 WEEKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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339 | 8" x2"Saddle, C900 $ 98.95s| $  161.26] 16 WEEKS | §  110.82 ;ﬁ;ﬁ;"t $  124.81]4-36 WEEKS] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
340 | 8" x3/4"Saddle, PVC $ 63.12| $  102.85] 16 WEEKS | § 70.70 3\;;253; $ 74.62|4-36 WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
341 | 8"x 1"Saddle, PVC $ 63.12| $  102.85] 16 WEEKS | § 70.70 3\;;253; $ 74.62|4-36 WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
342 | 8"x2"Saddle, PVC $ 89.35] §  145.66] 16 WEEKS | §  100.07 3\;;253; $  112.84|4-36 WEEKS] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
343 | 10" x 3/4" Saddle, C900 & PVC $ 12178 $  283.28] 16 WEEKS | §  136.39 3\;;253; NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
344 | 10" x 1" Saddle, C900 & PVC $ 173.73|$ 28328 16 WEEKS | §  136.39 ‘,3\;;253; NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
345 | 10" x 2" Saddle, C900 & PVC $ 173.73|$  283.28] 16 WEEKS | §  194.58 ;i;ﬁja(’t $  212.15]|4-36 WEEKS] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
346 | 10" x 3/4" Saddle, Ductile Iron $ 15700 NOBID NOBID |$§  168.74 ;i;ﬁja(’t NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
347 | 10" x 1" Saddle, Ductile Iron $ 15700 NOBID NOBID |$§  168.74 ;i;ﬁja(’t NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
348 | 10" x 2" Saddle, Ductile Iron $ 18520| NOBID NOBID |$§  199.04 ;i;ﬁja(’t NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
349 | 12" x3/4" Saddle, C900 & PVC $ 107.75]$  305.17]| 16 WEEKS | §  181.44 ;i;ﬁja(’t NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
350 | 12"x 1" Saddle, C900 & PVC $ 19483|$ 305.17]| 16 WEEKS | §  181.44 ‘,3\;3:53; NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
351 12" x 2" Saddle, C900 & PVC $ 16201|$  305.17] 16 WEEKS | §  209.62 ‘,3\;;::53; $  227.29]|4-36 WEEKS] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
352 | 12" x 3/4" Saddle, Ductile Iron $ 94371 NoOBID NOBID |§ 19748 ‘,3\;;::53; NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
353 | 12" x 1" Saddle, Ductile Iron $ 94.37] NoOBID NOBID |§ 19748 ‘,3\;;::53; NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
354 | 12" x 2 Saddle, Ductile Iron $ 10621] NoOBID NOBID |§ 22676 ‘,3\;;::53; NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
355 | 10" x 2" Saddle, Ductile Iron $ 18520| NOBID NOBID |$§  199.04 ‘,3\;;::53; NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
356 3/4" Endopure Polyethylene Tubing, 200 PSI Ultra High Density $ 0.35] $ 0.41] 4WEEKS | $ 0.39 V\?e:)ks' it $ 0.35] 2-10 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
357 | 3/4" Stainless Steel Inserts $ 1.49| NOBID NOBID | § 1.58 Zaﬁ:is“:fn‘:': $ 1.75| 2-10 weeks | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
358 1" Endopure Polyethylene Tubing, 200 PSI Ultra High Density $ 0.52] $ 0.65] 4 WEEKS | $ 0.53 V\(/)e:)ksl it $ 0.54 ] 2-10 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
359 | 1" Stainless Steel Insert $ 1.58] NOBID NoBID | § 1.67 Zaﬁ:is“:fn‘:': $ 2.00] 210 weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
360 1 1/4" Endopure Polyethylene Tubing, 200 PSI Ultra High Density $ 091] $ 0.79] 4 WEEKS $ 1.06 V\(/)e:)ksl it NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
361 1 1/4" Stainless Steel Insert $ 1.76] NOBID NOBID | § 2.05 Zaﬁ:is“:fn‘:': NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
362 1 1/2" Endopure Polyethylene Tubing, 200 PSI Ultra High Density | $ 1.24] $ 1.33] 4WEEKS | $ 1.65 VSEZ(S' i ¢ $ 1.49] 2-10 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
363 | 1 1/2" Stainless Steel Inserts $ 1.97] NoBID NoBID |§ 2.31 Za:"tsis“;fn‘:';s $ 2.45| 2-10weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
364 2" Endopure Polyethylene Tubing, 200 PSI Ultra High Density $ 1.96] $ 2.20] 4 WEEKS $ 2.60 V\(/)eteoksl it $ 1.98] 2-10 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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tem# | Description 202ZLowBid [ core g main | e EMANT oy [FRvesTead [ pguson | Forauson T cppy [ Frowlead Ty [ AVTLead
365 | 2"Stainless Steel Insert $ 2.17| wNoBID NOBID | § 2.31 Za:z:is‘";ie;': $ 2.79] 2210 weeks | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
366 | Castlron Valve Box, Short $ 71.00] $ 92.00| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 88.64 veet;s' gt $ 99.00]2-10 WEEKS| NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
367 | Castlron Valve Box, Tall $ Is 12300 46wWEEKS | § 11257 veet;s' gt $  168.97|2-10weeks| wNoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
368 | Castlron Valve Box Extension, 1" $ 16.61] $ 21.44| 4-6 WEEKS | § 19.93 veet;s' gt $ 23.76]2-10 WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
369 | Castlron Valve Box Extension, 2" $ 21.67] $ 27.90| 4-6 WEEKS | § 26.00 veet;s' gt $ 31.33]2-10 WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
370 | Castlron Valve Box Extension, 4" $ 31.78] $ 40.32| 4-6 WEEKS | § 38.13 V\?et:ks' gt $ 44.11]2-10 WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
371 | Castlron Valve Box Extension, 6" $ 43.33] $ 55.80| 4-6 WEEKs | § 52.00 V\?et;’ks' (;t $ 65.65]2-10 WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
372 | Missouri Top Hat Valve Box Top with Lid $ 30.87] § 40.00| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 53.89 V\?et;’ks' (; s 45.38]2-10 WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
373 | Missouri Top Hats (Lids Only) $ -1 28.00| 4-6 WEEKS | $ 29.12 V\?et;’ks' (; s 45.38]2-10 WEEKS| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
374 | 3/4"x 1" Ball Valve Curb Stop, CTS x CTS $ -| nw~osD NOBID |$ 76.40 \,3\;;253; $ 85.81] 436 weeks | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
375 | 3/4"Ball Valve Curb Stop, CTS x CTS $ 20.52] $ 97.72| 26 WEEKs | § 43.55 \,3\;;253; $ 80.96] 436 weeks | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
376 | 3/4"Ball Valve Curb Stop, FIPT X FIPT $ 48.84] $ 76.87| 26 WEEKS | § 54.70 \,3\;;:53; $ 57.91| 436 weeks | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
377 | 3/4" Coppersetter with Ball Valve $ 16078]$  197.63| 26 WEEKS | §  180.05 ‘,3\; g:ja(’t $ 182.83| 436 weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
378 | 3/4" Corporation Stop $ 31.04] $ 47.31| 26 WEEKS | § 34.75 \,3\;;:53; $ 35.89] 436 weeks | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
379 | 3/4" val-matic Air Relief Valve $ 23400]$ 33800 $ 36000 4;;:;5“:?;';5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
380 | 1"Angled Meter Valve $ 98.74] $  147.63| 26 wEEKS | § 11059 ‘,3\; g:ja(’t NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
381 | 1" Ball Valve Curb Stop, CTS x CTS $ 9451 s 147.33| 26 weEks | §  105.85 \,3\;;:53; $  112.07]| 436 weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
382 | 1"Ball Valve FIPT x FIPT $ 75.92] NoOBID NOBID |§ 85.03 ‘,3\,2::53; $ 90.61] 436 weeks | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
383 | 1" Coppersetter with Ball Valve $ 265.64|$ 377.11] 26 WEEKSs | §  297.51 ‘,3\2 ;:fa(’t $  309.88| 436 weeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
384 | 1"Corporation Stop $ 46.94] $ 72.60| 26 weEks | § 52.58 ;i::fa(’t $ 55.02| 436 weeks | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
385 | 1 1/4"Ball Valve Curb Stop, FIPT x FIPT $ 12370] NoOBID NOBID |$§ 13855 ‘,3\2 ;:fa(’t $ 151.56]| 436 weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
386 | 1 1/2"Ball Valve Curb Stop, FIPT x FIPT $ 15545| NOBID NOBID |$  174.10 V3Vi ;:fa(’t $ 18258 436 weeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
387 | 11/2"Ball Valve Curb Stop, MIPT x FIPT $ 179.33] NoOBID NOBID |$§ 20085 ‘,3\2 ;:fa(’t $  21450| 436 weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
388 1 1/2" Copper setter with Ball Valve $ 943.32] $ 1,519.71] 26 WEEKS | $ 1,056.52 v3vze;:s3a6t $ 1,118.67] 4-36 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
389 | 2"Ball Valve Curb Stop, MIPT x FIPT $ 269.70] NoOBID NoBID |§ 30206 ;i;ﬁfa(’t $  30671]| 436weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
390 | 2"Ball Valve Curb Stop, FIPT x FIPT $ 227235] NoBID NOBID |$  254.64 ‘,3\; ;:f:t $ 27551]| 436 weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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.Q. Hardin County Water 2023 Annual Material Bid

dheddd District No. 2 Bid Tabulation

2023 Material Bid Pricing
. 2022 Low Bid . Core & Main Hayes Lead Ferguson Frew Lead AVT Lead
Item # Description Price Core & Main Lead Times Hayes Times Ferguson Lead Times FREWX/ Times AVT Times
391 2" Copper setter with Ball Valve $ 994.15|$ 1,884.83| 26 WEEKS | § 1,113.43 3\; ;253; $  1,178.94] 4-36 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
392 | 3"Flanged Gate Valve w/ Handwheel $ 44580 NOBID NOBID |$§ 79164 Za:z:is‘";ie;': NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
393 4" Mechanical Joint Gate Valve, Resilient Wedge, Epoxy Coated, s 50249|s 73587| 26 wEEks | s sz1.00]? 0 Weels) ¢ 21473 2-24 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Open Left at this time
394 | 4" Tapping Valve, Resilient Wedge, Epoxy Coated, Open Left $ 633.49|$  929.01| 26 WEEKs | $  1,036.00 Zaﬁ:is“;ie;': $  900.84| 2-24 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
395 6" Mechanical Joint Gate Valve, Resilient Wedge, Epoxy Coated, s  o64122]s  93356| 26 weEEks | s 1.049.00]2 A Weels) ¢ 958 25| 2-24 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Open Left at this time
396 | 6" Tapping Valve, Resilient Wedge, Epoxy Coated, Open Left $ 895.04|$ 1,309.90] 26 WEEKS | § 1,462.00 Za:C:;S"‘:ie;': $  1,297.05| 224 weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
397 | 8 Mechanical Joint Gate Valve, Resilient Wedge, Epoxy Coated, | ¢ 4 o1 30) ¢ 1491.29] 26 weeks | §  1.668.00]% 122 Weeksl ¢ 4 450.03| 2-24 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Open Left at this time
398 | 8 Tapping Valve, Resilient Wedge, Epoxy Coated, Open Left $ 1,329.25]$ 1,940.70| 26 WEEKS | § 2,158.00 Zaﬁ;:‘:f:":_f $  1,930.32] 2-24weeks| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
399 | 3" Wilkins 350L Dual check valve, with valves $ -1s 2341.00] 3-4wWeeks | § 185882 Za?:sis"‘:f;f NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
400 | 4"EZ Valve, Open Left, Cl, DI, C900, (4.80-5.00) $ -1 wNoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$§ 4329.31] 2weeks
401 4" Wilkins 350L Dual Check Valve, With Valves $ -1s 2355.00] 3-4WEEKS | § 1,975.29 Za?:sis"‘:f;f NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
402 | 6"EZ Valve, Open Left, Cl, DI, C900 (6.90-7.10) $ -1 wNoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$§ 474257| 2weeks
403 | 6" Wilkins 350L dual check valve, with valves $ -1s 3422.00] 3-4WEEks | § 3.152.94 Zaz‘;sis‘":f;': NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
404 | 8"EZValve, Open Left, Cl, DI, C900 (9.05-9.15) $ -1 wNoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$§ 523822| 2weeks
405 10" EZ Valve, Open Left, Cl, DI, C900 (11.10-11.20) $ -1 wNoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$§ 8586.66] 2weeks
g || Wil e L R NN RIS A e e (I ek s 232930 26 weeks | s 2599.00]2 04 Weeksl ¢ 5377.44) 42aweeks| NoOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Open Left at this time
407 12" EZ Valve, Open Left, Cl, DI, C900 (13.2-13.30) $ -1 wNoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |$§ 9867.59| 2weeks
|| e bl e L SR AN I A e e (I ek e s 294495| 26 weeks | s 3,289.00]2 0 Weeksl ¢ 5 93159) 424 weeks| NoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Open Left at this time
409 16" Mechanical Joint Butterfly Valve, Epoxy Coated, Open Left S = NO BID NO BID $ 4,686.25 vzv(;;:szast $ 3,689.43] 4-24 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
410 20" Mechanical Joint Butterfly Valve, Epoxy Coated, Open Left $ - NO BID NO BID $ 7,295.00 vzv(;;:szast $ 5,346.96] 4-24 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
411 24" Mechanical Joint Butterfly Valve, Epoxy Coated, Open Left S - NO BID NO BID $ 10,983.75 vzv(;;:szast $ 8,194.69] 4-24 weeks NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Page 16 of 16



