

**2022 Water Treatment Plant Chemical Bid Tabulation
Hardin County Water District No. 2
Bid Number 2022-001**

bid opening date 2/10/2022

Item#	Item Description	Bidders									
		US Alco	Shannon Chemical Corp.	Univar	Brenntag	Hawkins	Water Solutions Unilimited	JCI Jones	Chemical Resources	Chemtrade	Calbot Norit Americas Inc.
1	Potassium Permanganate 330# drums	no bid	\$3.0700*	no bid	\$4.2750	\$4.1500	no bid	no bid	\$4.3000	no bid	no bid
2	Potassium Permanganate 55# buckets	no bid	\$2.9700*	no bid	\$4.3950	\$4.3800	no bid	no bid	\$4.5500	no bid	no bid
3	Hydrofluosilicic Acid -Bulk	no bid	\$0.6770	\$0.2400	\$0.2250	\$0.3700	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid
4	Chlorine	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.7695	\$0.6700	no bid	\$1.1250	no bid	no bid	no bid
5	Powdered Activated Carbon - bulk bags	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.7150	\$1.2600	no bid	no bid	\$0.9100	no bid	\$1.3000
6	Powdered Activated Carbon - 40-55lb bags	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.7450	\$1.2600	no bid	no bid	\$1.0900	no bid	no bid
7	Polyaluminum Chloride	\$0.2700	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.2100	no bid
8	Sodium Hydroxide - 25%	no bid	no bid	\$0.1341	\$0.1278	\$0.2000	\$0.3000	\$0.1127	\$0.1300	no bid	no bid
9	Liquid Ammonium Sulfate (LAS) 40%	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.2500	\$0.2200	\$0.2700	no bid	no bid	\$0.3600	no bid

*Product bid does not meet specifications; Yellow highlights indicate lowest bid
All prices are per pound basis.