

**2020 Water Treatment Plant Chemical Bid Tabulation  
Hardin County Water District No. 2  
Bid Number 2020 - 003**

bid opening date 2/11/2020

Item#	Item Description	Bidders															2019 Prices
		Hawkins Inc.	JCI Jones Chemical, Inc.	GEO Specialty Chemicals	Thatcher Chemical of Florida	Shannon Chemical Corporation	Usalco	Chemtrade	Chemical Resources Inc.	Cabot Norit Americas, Inc.	Pencoco, Inc.	Brenntag Mid-South, Inc.	Jacobi Carbons, Inc.	Calgon Carbon	Prominent Systems, Inc.	Univar Solutions	
1	Potassium Permanganate 330# drums	\$3.3000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$4.9300	no bid	no bid	\$3.5000	no bid	no bid	\$3.0600	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$3.2120	\$3.0400
2	Potassium Permanganate 55# buckets	\$3.5000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$4.9300	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$3.0600	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$3.2120	\$3.1000
3	Hydrofluosilicic Acid -Bulk	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.4700	no bid	no bid	\$0.2500	no bid	\$0.2490	\$0.2190	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.1950	\$0.1790
4	Hydrofluosilicic Acid -drums	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.5700	no bid	no bid	\$0.2800	no bid	no bid	\$0.2590	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.2972	\$0.2490
5	Chlorine	no bid	\$0.2320	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.2100	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.2199
6	Powdered Activated Carbon - bulk bags	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.6500	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.5190	\$0.6500	no bid	\$0.5150	\$0.6200	\$0.8700	\$0.6800	no bid	\$0.5300
7	Powdered Activated Carbon - 40-55lb bags	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.5190	\$0.7000	no bid	\$0.5150	\$0.6200	\$1.1700	\$0.7200	no bid	\$0.5300
8	Polyaluminum Chloride	no bid	no bid	Ultrafloc 1004 0.16 2105 0.17	no bid	no bid	\$0.1700	\$0.1545	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.2400	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.1475
9	Sodium Hydroxide - 25%	no bid	\$0.0730	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.0790	no bid	no bid	\$0.0775	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.0806	\$0.0890
10	Liquid Ammonium Sulfate (LAS) 40%	\$0.1900	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.1845	\$0.3000	no bid	no bid	\$0.2100	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.1600

Yellow highlight denotes lowest bid for that product